
 
 
 
 
 

BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS 
 MEETING AGENDA 
   

Rowland Water District 
3021 S. Fullerton Road 

Rowland Heights, CA 91748 
 
 

Thursday, February 8, 2018 
To begin at 7:00 A.M. 

 
 

Each item on the agenda shall be deemed to include any appropriate motion, resolution, or ordinance, to 
take action on any item. 
 
Materials related to an item on this agenda submitted after distribution of the agenda packet are available for 
public review during regular business hours at the Walnut Valley Water District office, located at 271 S. Brea 
Canyon Road, Walnut, California. 

 
  

I. Welcome and Introductions                                                                                       Chairman Ebenkamp 
 

II. Flag Salute 
 

III. Roll Call   Commissioner Lewis ______     Commissioner Ebenkamp    ______ 
  Commissioner Lima ______   Commissioner Lee     ______ 

IV. Public Comment 
The Chair may impose reasonable limitations on public comments to assure an orderly and timely 
meeting. 

 
V. Approval of Minutes for December 7, 2017 and January 10, 2018 (attachment)      Chairman Ebenkamp 

 a.   Discussion b.    Action Taken 
 

VI. Receive and File Rowland and Walnut Valley Water Districts’ 2018                         Chairman Ebenkamp 
PBWA Board Member Appointment Resolutions (attachment)         

 a.   Discussion b.    Action Taken 
 

VII. Annual Selection of Commission Officers and Commission Staff (attachment)                Chair  
a.   Discussion b.    Action Taken 
 

VIII. 2016-17 Audited Financial Statements Prepared by Davis Farr (telephone call)          Mr. Teuber 
a.   Discussion b.    Action Taken 

 
IX. Review of Financial Statements: Second Quarter FY 2017-18 (attachment)               Mr. Teuber 

 a.    Discussion b.    Action Taken 
 

X. Regional Water Supply Reliability Program Updates/Status:             Mr. Coleman/Mr. Holmes 
(1) California Domestic Water Company 

a. Project Update (verbal)                             
i.  Discussion   ii.    Action Taken 
 
 



(2) Pathfinder              Mr. Hitchman 
a.  Consider Award of Contract for the 20” Water Transmission Main 

   (P.N. PB17-0004) (attachment)                             
i. Discussion   ii.    Action Taken 

b.  Project Update (verbal)                             
i. Discussion   ii.    Action Taken 

 
(3) Pomona Basin Regional Groundwater Project              

a.  Project Update (verbal) 
b.   Update: Old Baldy Well Agreement (attachment) 
c.   Update: Proposition 84 (verbal)  

i. Discussion   ii.    Action Taken 
 

(4) Central Basin Well              
a.  Project Update (verbal)                             

 
(5) Update: Proposition 1 Integrated Regional Water Management Grant (attachment)                           

a. Discussion    b.    Action Taken 
 

XI. Commission Follow-Up (attachment)                              
a.   Discussion    b.    Action Taken   

 
XII. Commissioner Comments                                

a.   Discussion    b.    Action Taken 
 

XIII. Items for Future Discussion/Review                 Chair                  
a.   Discussion    b.    Action Taken  

 
XIV. Attorney’s Report 

a. Legal Counsel will report on matters of interest or having an effect on the Agency 
 

XV. Public Comment on Closed Session                 Chair 
 

XVI. Closed Session 
(1) CONFERENCE WITH REAL PROPERTY NEGOTIATOR [§54956.8] 

Property: Acquisition and/or Lease 
 Negotiators: Tom Coleman, Michael Holmes 
 Negotiating Parties: Various Property Owners 
 Under Negotiations: Price and Payment Term 

 
(2) CONFERENCE WITH REAL PROPERTY NEGOTIATOR [§54956.8] 

Property: Acquisition and/or Lease of Central Basin and Main San Gabriel Basin Water Rights 
Negotiators: Tom Coleman, Michael Holmes 
Negotiating Parties: Various Water Rights Holders 
Under Negotiations: Price and Payment Term 

 
(3) CONFERENCE WITH LEGAL COUNSEL- ANTICIPATED LITIGATION [§54956.9(d)(4)] 

Initiation of Litigation – One Potential Case  
 

XVII. Reconvene in Open Session 
Report of action, if any, taken in Closed Session 

 
• Next Commission Meeting: Thursday, April 5, 2018, 7:00 a.m., at Walnut Valley Water District 

 
 Adjournment 



 
 

  

MINUTES OF MEETING 
OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF 

PUENTE BASIN WATER AGENCY 
 
 

December 7, 2017 
At the Offices of the  

Walnut Valley Water District  
 
  

COMMISSIONERS PRESENT: 
Theodore L. Ebenkamp, Chair 
Anthony Lima, Vice-Chair 
Theresa Lee, Commissioner 
Robert Lewis, Commissioner 

STAFF PRESENT: 
Mike Holmes, Administrative Officer 
Tom Coleman, Assistant Administrative Officer 
Jim Ciampa, Legal Counsel 
Brian Teuber, Treasurer 
Sean Henry, Assistant Treasurer 
Carmen Fleming, Secretary 
 
 

Staff, guests and others in attendance: Ms. Rose Perea, and Mr. Dave Warren, Rowland Water District, 
and Mr. Erik Hitchman, Walnut Valley Water District. 
 
 
The meeting was called to order at 7:00 a.m. with Chair Ebenkamp presiding. 
 
Item IV: Public Comment 
None. 
 
Item V: Approval of Minutes for November 9, 2017 

Upon consideration thereof, it was moved by Commissioner Lima, seconded by 
Commissioner Lee and unanimously carried (4-0) to approve the minutes of the Commission 
meeting held on November 9, 2017. 

 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 4-0 vote  

 
Item VI: Regional Water Supply Reliability Program Updates/Status: 
(1) California Domestic Water Company 

♦ Project Update: Mr. Coleman reported that the Cal Domestic project is continuing to produce 
water. Staff is maintaining a one-pump flow and trying to run two pumps as frequently as 
possible. 
 

(2) Pathfinder  
♦ Project Update: Mr. Hitchman reported that the plans have gone through plan-check process with 

Rowland Water District and staff will be putting bid packets together for the pipeline portion, to be 
disbursed the beginning of the year. Staff will continue the application process with Southern 
California Edison. 

 
(3) Pomona Basin Regional Groundwater Project 

  
a. Update: Old Baldy Well Agreement: Mr. Holmes reported that staff will meet with the City of La 

Verne to review several outstanding items related to the draft agreement. City of La Verne staff 
will present the final agreement to City Council for approval in the next month or so.  

b. Update: Proposition 84:  Due to the delay with the City of La Verne agreement, Ms. Wendy La, of 
LASER, Inc. will request an extension on the filing deadline on this item. 

 
(4) Central Basin Well 

a. Project Update: Mr. Coleman stated that staff met with Cal Domestic and has decided to suspend 
the feasibility study with the City of Whittier.  Staff will coordinate a meeting with a Central Basin 
Hydrogeologist to review other options. 



 
 

  

 
(5) Update: Proposition 1 Integrated Regional Water Management Grant:  Mr. Holmes reported that staff 

is continuing to work with LASER, Inc., on potential projects for which grant funding may be sought. 
The final draft package is under review with a tentative release date in February 2018. 

 
Item VII: PBWA’s Proposed 2018 Meeting Schedule and Approval of Resolution No. 12-17-009 
Noting Same 
 
♦ Mr. Holmes stated that the Commission is required to pass a “Meeting Resolution” per State Law. As 

needed, meeting times may be changed by a vote. 
 

Upon consideration thereof, it was moved by Commissioner Lima, seconded by 
Commissioner Lewis and unanimously carried (4-0), to approve Resolution No. 12-17-009, setting 
forth the 2018 meeting schedule for the Puente Basin Water Agency. A roll call vote was then 
taken: 
 

Yes:    Ebenkamp, Lee, Lewis, Lima 
Noes:  None 
Motion Passed (4-0) 

 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 4-0 vote  

 
Item VIII: Commission Follow-Up 
♦ The Commission received a follow-up on report on prior actions. 

 
Item IX: Commissioner Comments 
None. 
 
Item X: Items for Future Discussion/Review 
♦ Staff will present the Audit at the February meeting. 
 
Item XI: Attorney’s Report 
Nothing to report. 
 
Item XII: Public Comment on Closed Session 
There were no requests to comment on closed session. 
 
Item XIII: Closed Session at 7:33 a.m.  
(1) The Commission met in closed session in accordance with Government Code [§54956.8] to discuss 

one real property matter pertaining to the acquisition of Central Basin and Main San Gabriel water 
rights.  The negotiators are Mr. Tom Coleman and Mr. Michael Holmes.  The negotiating parties are 
various water rights holders.  Under negotiations are the price and terms of payment. 
  
• No discussion on this item. 

 
(2) The Commission met in closed session in accordance with Government Code [§54956.8] to discuss 

one real property matter.  The negotiators are Mr. Tom Coleman and Mr. Michael Holmes.  The 
negotiating parties are various water rights holders.  Under negotiations are the price and terms of 
payment. 
 
• No discussion on this item. 
 

(3) The Commission was briefed on the facts and circumstances of anticipated litigation under 
Government Code Section [§54956.9(d)(4)] (one case) and no reportable action under the Brown Act 
was taken. 

 
 
 



 
 

  

Item XIV: Reconvene in Open Session at 7:56 a.m. – see above for the closed session report 
concerning Item 3. 
 
Adjournment – 7:57 a.m. 

There being no further business to discuss, upon consideration thereof, it was moved by 
Commissioner Lima, seconded by Commissioner Lee and unanimously carried (4-0), to adjourn 
the Commission meeting. 
 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 4-0 vote 



 
 

  

MINUTES OF MEETING 
OF THE BOARD OF COMMISSIONERS OF 

PUENTE BASIN WATER AGENCY 
 
 

January 10, 2018 
At the Offices of the  

Walnut Valley Water District  
 
  

COMMISSIONERS PRESENT: 
Theodore L. Ebenkamp, Chair 
Anthony Lima, Vice-Chair 
Theresa Lee, Commissioner 
 
ABSENT: 
Robert Lewis, Commissioner 
 
 

STAFF PRESENT: 
Mike Holmes, Administrative Officer 
Tom Coleman, Assistant Administrative Officer 
Jim Ciampa, Legal Counsel (via phone) 
Brian Teuber, Treasurer 
Sean Henry, Assistant Treasurer 
Carmen Fleming, Secretary 
 

Staff, guests and others in attendance: Ms. Rose Perea, and Mr. Dave Warren, Rowland Water District, 
and Mr. Erik Hitchman, Walnut Valley Water District. 
 
 
The meeting was called to order at 7:04 a.m. with Chair Ebenkamp presiding. 
 
Item IV: Public Comment 
None. 
 
Item V: Consider Approval of the Old Baldy Well Agreement 
Mr. Holmes stated that staff met with the City of La Verne to discuss final terms of the agreement. The 
agreement was finalized and is ready to be signed by the PBWA. The City of La Verne is scheduled to 
take this agreement to their February City Council meeting for consideration and approval.  
 

Upon consideration thereof, it was moved by Commissioner Lima, seconded by 
Commissioner Lee and unanimously carried (3-0) to approve the signing of the Old Baldy 
agreement between the Puente Basin Water Agency and the City of La Verne. 

 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 3-0 vote  

 
Item VI: Consideration and Possible Approval for Awarding a Contract to Doty Bros. Inc. for 
Immediate Installation of Approximately 1,200 feet of Pipeline on Pathfinder Rd. 
 
♦ Mr. Hitchman stated that the Pathfinder pipeline project was out to bid. He also stated that a County 

of Los Angeles paving project has presented a conflict. Staff agreed that it would be necessary to 
place approximately 1,200 feet of pipe on Pathfinder as soon as possible to avoid construction 
conflicts with the County’s project. 
  
Upon consideration thereof, it was moved by Commissioner Lee, seconded by Commissioner 

Lima and unanimously carried (3-0) to approve and award a contract to Doty Bros. Inc. for 
immediate installation of approximately 1,200 feet of pipeline on Pathfinder Rd. 

 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 3-0 vote  
 
Item VII: Public Comment on Closed Session 
There were no requests to comment on closed session. 
 



 
 

  

Item VIII: Closed Session at 7:23 a.m.  
(1) The Commission was briefed on the facts and circumstances of anticipated litigation under 

Government Code Section [§54956.9(d)(4)] (one case) and no reportable action under the Brown Act 
was taken. 

 
Item IX: Reconvene in Open Session at 7:27 a.m. – see above for the closed session report 
concerning Item 1. 
 
Adjournment – 7:27 a.m. 

There being no further business to discuss, upon consideration thereof, it was moved by 
Commissioner Lima, seconded by Commissioner Lee and unanimously carried (3-0), to adjourn 
the Commission meeting. 
 
   Chair Ebenkamp indicated that the motion was approved by a 3-0 vote 



 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:  Michael Holmes 
RE: Receive and File Rowland and Walnut Valley Water Districts’ 2018 PBWA 

Board Member Appointment Resolutions 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
Receive and file Resolution No. 12.1-2017, Rowland Water District, and Resolution No. 01-18-648, 
Walnut Valley Water District. 
 
Background 
 
Attachments: 
 Rowland Water District Board approval documents 
 Walnut Valley Water District Board approval documents 
 









 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:  Michael Holmes 
RE: Annual Selection of Commission Officers and Commission Staff 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the Commissioners: 
 
1. Conduct the annual selection of officers as set forth in the Joint Powers Agreement (JPA);1  

and the,  
 

2. Annual appointment of Secretary, Treasurer, Administrative Officer, Assistant Administrative 
Officer and Assistant Treasurer as set forth in the JPA. 
 

Background  
 
At February’s PBWA meeting the amended JPA (referenced below) directs the selection of 
Commission officers:   
 
1. Section of Chair and Vice-Chair (as amended on January 19, 2012)  

 
In the JPA, subdivision 1 of Section E, it states, 
 

At the Commission meeting in February, there shall be selected from the Commission a 
Chairman and a Vice Chairman. When the Commissioners select a Chairman from Walnut, the 
Vice Chairman shall be from Rowland.  In that instance, for the following year, the new Chairman 
shall be from Rowland and the Vice Chairman shall be from Walnut.  Such offices shall alternate 
between the Commissioners from Walnut and Rowland each year. 

 
Following is the rotation for 2018:     

 
Position Current Rotation for 2018 
Chairman Mr. Ebenkamp—WVWD RWD Designee 

Vice-Chairman Mr. Lima—RWD WVWD Designee 

 

                                                
1 As amended at the PBWA’s Jan 19, 2012, meeting and approved by the Rowland and Walnut Water Districts Board 
of Directors. Further amendments took place at the Feb 7, 2017, Commission meeting where Section E(1) authorizes 
the Commission to appoint additional officers as they deem appropriate (also refer to Item No. 2 of this report). 



 

 
2. Appointment of Secretary, Treasurer, Administrative Officer, Assistant Administrative 

Officer, and the Assistant Treasurer (as amended on January 19, 2012 and February 7, 
2017) 
 
The JPA further states in subdivision 1 of Section E, 
 

There shall also be a Secretary, Treasurer, and Administrative Officer.  The Secretary of the 
Commission shall rotate annually between the General Manager of Walnut, or Walnut’s General 
Manager’s designee, and the General Manager of Rowland, or Rowland’s General Manager’s 
designee.  The Treasurer of the Commission shall be the Treasurer of Rowland or Rowland’s 
General Manager’s designee.  The Administrative Officer shall be the General Manager of 
Walnut, or Walnut’s General Manager’s designee.  

 
In addition to the officers specified in Section 2, above, Section E(1) of the Agency’s Joint 
Powers Agreement authorizes the Commission to appoint additional officers as they deem 
appropriate.  Accordingly, at the February 7, 2017, Commission meeting, approval was given 
to add Rowland’s General Manager, Mr. Tom Coleman, and Rowland’s Finance Officer, Mr. 
Sean Henry, as Assistant Administrative Officer and Assistant Treasurer, respectively, to 
these PBWA positions.   
 

 
Position Current 

Appointments Proposed for 2018 

Secretary 
(Rotates between RWD and WVWD) 

RWD Designee 
(Ms. Fleming) 

WVWD’s Designee  
(Ms. Fleming) 

Treasurer (RWD) RWD Designee 
(Mr. Teuber) 

RWD Designee 
(Mr. Teuber) 

Administrative Officer (WVWD) Mr. Holmes, WVWD Mr. Hitchman, WVWD 

Assistant Administrative Officer Mr. Coleman, RWD Mr. Coleman, RWD 

Assistant Treasurer Mr. Henry, RWD Mr. Henry, RWD 

 



 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:       Board of Commissioners 
FROM:       Brian Teuber 
RE:            2016-2017 Audited Financial Statements Prepared by Davis Farr 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the Commissioners receive, approve, and file: 
 
A. 2016-17 Audited Financial Statements; and 
B. Summary of Audit Results (SAS) 114 Letter 
 
 
Background  
 
A Davis Farr, LLP, representative will be participating in a teleconference to present the audited 
2016-17 financial statements.  The representative will review the firm’s findings and will be available 
to answer any questions. 
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February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:  Michael Holmes 
RE: Consider Award of Labor and Materials Contracts for the 20” Water Transmission Main 

P.N. PB17-0004 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
Request the Board of Commissioners: 
 
1. Authorize the Administrative Officer to execute contracts for labor and materials for the subject 

project per the following bid results: 
 
Bid Supplier Price Delivery 
Labor Doty Bros. $ 1,296,237.00  
Misc. Materials D’Angelo Co. $        4,466.79 4 days 
Service Materials Inland $      14,975.55 14 days 
Steel West Coast Pipe $    428,688.12 70-90 working days 
Valves S & J Supply $      21,238.62 1 day – 2 weeks 
 

 
Background Information 
 
The Rowland Water District (RWD) in partnership with the Walnut Valley Water District (WVWD) are 
developing this project to ensure that Cal Domestic Project facilities, currently being utilized to move 
stored water from the Main San Gabriel Basin, as well as future groundwater projects in the Central 
Basin utilizing Cal Domestic Project Facilities can be maximized for the benefit of both Districts. 
  
In addition to the 20-inch pipeline, the project includes three interties between RWD’s transmission 
pipeline in Colima Road/Golden Springs Drive and WVWD’s distribution system at Otterbein Avenue, 
Hallgreen Drive, and between Lemon Avenue and Brea Canyon Road. 
 
Bids were solicited and received by the WVWD staff to provide the labor and materials for the 20” 
pipeline.  Attached for your information are bid recaps for labor and material bids, project description, 
and a map.   
 
 
 
Attachments 

 



CONTRACTORS TOTAL

Brkich $1,874,600.00
Doty Bros. $1,296,237.00

Griffith No Bid
McKinney No Bid

Paulus $1,423,429.00
Rasic $2,079,615.00

Sully-Miller $1,560,000.00

PUENTE BASIN WATER AGENCY

Labor Bid Results

20" Water Transmission Main
The Joint Effort Regional Water Supply Project

January 29, 2018 @ 2:00 PM
Project No. PB17-0004
Cal Domestic Project



Vendor Valves Service Materials Misc. Materials

C. Wells No Bid No Bid No Bid

D'Angelo 27,475.74$                  15,256.01$                  4,466.79$                    

Core & Main No Bid No Bid No Bid

Ferguson 24,539.99$                  15,527.07$                  5,522.72$                    

Inland 22,068.63$                  14,975.55$                  5,104.71$                    

S&J Supply 21,238.62$                  15,344.90$                  5,118.36$                    

United 21,472.95$                  16,653.64$                  5,095.78$                    

Western 23,267.00$                  15,276.73$                  4,888.15$                    

Project No. PB17-0004
January 26, 2018 @ 10:00 AM

PUENTE BASIN WATER AGENCY
271 South Brea Canyon Road, Walnut, CA 91789

Valves, Service & Misc Materials Bid Results

20" Water Transmission Main
Pathfinder Rd. Between Harbor Blvd. and Nogales St.



Manufacturers TOTAL

Ameron $791,995.98

Imperial Pipe No Bid

Northwest Pipe No Bid

Southland Pipe No Bid

West Coast Pipe $428,688.12

The apparent low bidder is McKinney

PUENTE BASIN WATER AGENCY

Bid Results for Revised List of Steel M.L.&C. Pipe
20" Water Transmission Main

Pathfinder Rd. Between Harbor Blvd. and Nogales St.
Monday, January 29, 2018 @ 10:00AM



 
 

Pathfinder Pipeline and Intertie Project 

 

Annual Capacity:   Up to 4,000 acre feet per year 

Source of Supply:   Stored water previously purchased by the Districts (MWD untreated water) and stored 
in the Main San Gabriel Valley Basin under the terms of a Storage and Export between 
Puente Basin Water Agency and the Main San Gabriel Basin Watermaster. Water will 
be produced through the Cal Domestic Project Facilities. 

 Additional water from a future Central Basin groundwater project using both 
groundwater production rights as well as possible future stored water in the Central 
Basin may also be moved through this project in the future. 

Project Facilities:  The project consists of the installation of approximately 8,400 feet of 20-inch diameter 
cement mortar lined and coated steel pipe, and up to four metered intertie structures 
between Rowland’s existing pipeline in Colima  

Project Description: 

The Walnut Valley Water District (WVWD) in partnership with the Rowland Water District (RWD) are 
developing this project to ensure that Cal Domestic Project facilities, currently being utilized to move 
stored water from the Main San Gabriel Basin, as well as future groundwater projects in the Central Basin 
utilizing Cal Domestic Project Facilities can be maximized for the benefit of both Districts. 

In addition to the 20-inch pipeline, the project includes three interties between RWD’s transmission 
pipeline in Colima Road/Golden Springs Drive and WVWD’s distribution system at Otterbein Avenue, 
Hallgreen Drive, and between Lemon Avenue and Brea Canyon Road. 



 

Rowland WD 
Reservoirs 

Pathfinder Road Pipeline Project 

New Pipeline from Pathfinder Road 
to Nogales Street 
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February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:   Michael Holmes 
RE:   Update: Proposition 1—Integrated Regional Water Management Grant 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
That the Commission review and discuss the information provided. 
 
Background—Proposition 1 Integrated Regional Water Management Grant 
 
On November 4, 2014, California voters approved Proposition 1, the Water Quality, Supply, and 
Infrastructure Improvement Act of 2014. Proposition 1 authorized $510 million in Integrated 
Regional Water Management (IRWM) funding. Funds are allocated to the 12 hydrologic region-
based Funding Areas. 
 
The Proposition 1 IRWM Grant Program, administered by Department of Water Resources 
(DWR), provides funding for projects that help meet the long term water needs of the state, 
including: 
 
• Assisting water infrastructure systems adapt to climate change; 
• Providing incentives throughout each watershed to collaborate in managing the region's water 

resources and setting regional priorities for water infrastructure; and 
• Improving regional water self-reliance, while reducing reliance on Sacramento-San Joaquin 

Delta. 
 
Update: Proposition 1 IRWM Implementation Grant (Central Basin Well Project) 
 
• The “Concept Guidelines” were scheduled to be released sometime late last year or last month.  

For now, the best guess is a pre-release date of spring 2018.  These guidelines will initially be 
reviewed by a select, smaller group to review and comment and will not be available 
immediately for public review. 
   

• Summary of Current Grants:   
 The County staff reported that Prop 50 has been completed and DWR is finishing the audits 

of Prop 84 IRWM Grant Rounds 1, 2, and 3.   
 County staff also reported that they are still working the “time extension request” for the 

Upper SGVMWD’s Recycled Water Project as part of the update for Round 3 of the Prop 84 
IRWM Grant Funding. 
 

• IRWM Plan Amendments:  The County has submitted the IRWM Plan Amendments to DWR 
Dec 21, 2017.   Now we just await for DWR’s comments.  

http://www.water.ca.gov/irwm/grants/legislation.cfm
http://www.water.ca.gov/irwm/grants/legislation.cfm


 

 
 
 
 

 
 
February 8, 2018 
 
 
TO:  Board of Commissioners 
FROM:  Michael Holmes 
RE: Commission Follow Up 
 
 
Recommendation 
 
For information only. 

 
 

Background 
 
Following is an update regarding matters that have recently come before the Commission. 
 
 

Item Meeting  
Date Commission Activity Completed Follow-Up 

Proposition 84: 
Pomona Basin 
Groundwater Project 
– Old Baldy Well 
Lease Agreement 
with the City of La 
Verne 

10/5/17 
 

1/10/18 

Staff was authorized to 
finalize terms for the 
Old Baldy Well Lease 
Agreement with the 
City of La Verne 

Pending 

10/10/17: Rowland Water 
District’s Board of 
Directors ratified the 
Lease Agreement 
 
10/16/17: Walnut Valley 
Water District’s Board of 
Directors ratified the 
Lease Agreement 
 
1/10/18: Approved and 
signed by Commission 

Water Rights Lease 
of 1,000 acre feet for 
FY 2017-18 to 
Bellflower-Somerset 
Mutual Water Co. 

1/22/18  
Pending confirmation 
from the Water 
Replenishment District 
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